NORTH LONDONDERRY TOWNSHIP

TAB SHEET

2026 SANITARY SEWER LINE CLEANING TELEVISING

Bid Opening - March 5, 2026 - 10:15 a.m.

EST. FT. PERFOOT TOTAL
Arold Construction Co., Inc. Cleaning 34,422 2.50 86,055.00
51 Powder Mill Bridge Road Televising 34,422 1.50 51,633.00
Kingston, NY 12401
Total 137,688.00
Ditchcereek Utility Services, Inc. Cleaning 34,422 0.70 24,095.40
820 East Lincoln Avenue Televising 34,422 0.45 15,489.90
Myerstown, PA 17067
Total 39,585.30
Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC Cleaning 34,422 1.36 46,813.92
232 East Lancaster Road Televising 34,422 1.36 46,813.92
Harmony, PA 16037
Total 93,627.84
Jet Services, Inc. Cleaning 34,422
306 Red Oak Court Televising 34,422
Mars, PA 16046
Total NO BID
Mobile Dredging & Video Pipe Inc.  Cleaning 34,422 4.77 164,192.94
3100 Bethel Road Televising 34,422 4.77 164,192.94
Chester, PA 19013
Total 328,385.88
Mr. Rehab Inc. Cleaning 34,422
3 Long Lane Televising 34,422
Mechanicsburg, PA 17050
Total NO BID
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Pipe Data View Services I LLC Cleaning 34,422 0.70 24,095.40
9 Railroad Avenue Televising 34,422 0.55 18,932.10
Christiana, PA 17509
Total 43,027.50
Pipe Services Corporation Cleaning 34,422
665 Tower Lane Televising 34,422
West Chester, PA 19380
Total NO BID
Reybold Construction Group, LLC  Cleaning 34,422 2.00 68,844.00
116 East Scotland Drive Televising 34,422 2.45 84,333.90
Bear, DE 19701
Total 153,177.90
Sewer Specialty Services Co., Inc. Cleaning 34,422
2462 New Road Televising 34,422
Leicester, NY 14481
Total NO BID
Underground Services, Inc. Cleaning 34,422 11.91 409,966.02
24 Hagerty Boulevard, Suite 11 Televising 34,422 3.78 130,115.16
West Chester, PA 19382 BID CORRECTION - Based on Per Foot $$
Total 540,081.18
Utility Services Group Inc. Cleaning 34,422 1.50 51,633.00
1304 Slate Hill Road Televising 34,422 1.40 48,190.80
Camp Hill, PA 17011
Total 99,823.80
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Vortex Services LLC Cleaning 34,422 2.40 82,612.80
210 Bennett Road Televising 34,422 1.00 34,422.00

Freehold, NJ 07728
Total 117,034.80
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